
 

 

 

  

This charming, architecturally designed family 
cottage is in "like-new" condition. It features a 
wrap-around porch overlooking mountain & 
water views, enjoying the sights & sounds of 
Tumbo Channel & the Salish Sea. The main level 
has an open concept living space which 
includes a custom kitchen, dining & living areas 
with a wood burning stove to curl up around on 
cool winter evenings. There is also a powder 
room, laundry & utility space on the main level. 
The upper level has two spacious BRs 
separated by a luxurious 4-piece bath. The 
bathrooms & entrance have heated floors while 
the remainder has beautiful Canadian Maple 
wood floors. Ocean views can be enjoyed from 
every room! This is a well-built, easy to maintain 
home on 3+ acres which allows for a secondary 
dwelling. Private & tranquil property with natural 
surroundings. A retreat property for the whole 
family to enjoy. Close to a beach access and to 
Lighthouse Park at East Point. 
 

Oceanview Cottage 

470 East Point Rd 



 

 

  

470 East Point Rd 

Property Details 

 
 

Year Built: 2006 
 

Lot Acres:    3.36 
 

Bedrooms: 2 
 

Bathrooms: 2 
 

Fin SqFt: 1,140 
 

Unfin SqFt: 4384 
 

Bsmt: none 
 

 

Water: drilled well 
 

Waste: Septic Field 

 
 

Foundation:  
Concrete Poured 
 

Roof: Metal 
 

Ext Fin: Wood 
 

Fuel: Wood, Electric 
 

Heat: Wood Stove, 
Electric 
 

FP Location:   
Living Room 
 

Lot Features: 
-Ocean View 
-Low Maintenance 
-Acreage 
-Close to beach 
access 



 

     

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Plot Plan and Aerial View 

 

470 East Point Rd 



 

 

 

Google Area Map 

Subject Property 
470 East Point Road 

DISCLAIMER: While every effort is made to provide reliable information, Dockside Realty Ltd. makes no 

representations or warranties as to the accuracy of this brochure.  

All measurements are approximate and the buyer is responsible for verifying all data provided. 


